TOWN OF MANCHESTER
PURCHASING DEPARTMENT
494 MAIN STREET - PO BOX 191
MANCHESTER, CT 06045-0191

TABULATION FOR BID 21/22-58 ATHLETIC SUPPLIES
BID OPENED FEBRUARY 17, 2022

BSN Sports, LLC

Lyn Weiss, Senior Bid Specialist

PO Box 7726
Dalles, TX 75209-0726

Pyramid School Products

Kenneth D. Miller, Vice President

6510 North 54th Street
Tampa, FL 33610-1908

Riddell

James Brady, Bid Department Mgr
7501 Performance Lane

North Ridgeville, OH 44039

S & S Worldwide

Carol Mares, Bid Analyst
75 Mill Street
Colchester, CT 06415

Item # Description Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price Unit Price
1| Tachikara Volleyball - White 25.34 23.50 26.77 33.49
2| Worth UHD12SY 12" Hot Dot USSSA Slowpitch Softball-Dozen 49.87 46.50 no bid no bid
3| Softballs Worth Green Dot 11" COR-44 no bid 55.00 no bid no bid
4| Mini Red/White/Blue Basketball 3.42 no bid no bid 4.54
5| Franklin Competition Soccer Balls - Size 3 5.93 8.45 no bid 7.72
6| Penn Championship Game Tennis Balls - 12 Cans 37.92 24 cans/case 76.80 no bid 54.72
7|MacGregor Youth pitchersplante and anchor system 28.17 48.50 46.34 no bid
8| Franklin Competive Soccer Balls Size 3 5.93 8.45 no bid 7.72
9| Pro Style Rubber Hex Dumb Bell 55 Ib. 90.31 no bid no bid no bid
10| Pro Style Rubber Hex Dumb Bell 60 Ib. 98.54 no bid no bid no bid
11| Pro Style Rubber Hex Dumb Bell 65 Ib. 106.76 no bid no bid no bid
12| Pro Style Rubber Hex Dumb Bell 70 Ib. 114.97 no bid no bid no bid
13| Pro Style Rubber Hex Dumb Bell 75 Ib. 123.22 no bid no bid no bid
14| Pro Style Rubber Hex Dumb Bell 80 Ib. 131.43 no bid no bid no bid
15| Single Grip Handle Strap no bid no bid no bid no bid
16| Economy Front Mount Basketball Goal 82.83 49.95 no bid 51.00
17| Backboard Edge Padding 72" Wide, Black 109.56 168.00 no bid 145.00
18| Speed Rope 8' 1.04 1.35 no bid 1.78
19| Speed Rope 9' 1.11 1.40 no bid no bid
20| Speed Rope 10' 0.87 1.50 no bid 2.14
21| Premium Hanging Club Mat 17.26 no bid no bid 47.00
22| Yosuda Magnetic Resistence Exercise Bike no bid no bid no bid no bid
23| Super Sopper, 14 Gallon 1,112.83 no bid no bid no bid
24| Molded Rubber baseball base plug 2.43 2.80 7.75 no bid
25| Standard Weight Baseball/Little League Field Tarps:
25a | 18 ft circle, 8 oz standard weight 173.42 no bid no bid no bid
25b | 26 ft circle, 8 oz standard weight 266.88 no bid no bid no bid
25c¢ | 10 ft circle, 8 oz standard weight 147.56 no bid no bid no bid
26 | Double Play Rake 36" 51.63 no bid 96.40 no bid
27 | 8 oz. Windscreens 38 ft x 6 ft 164.16 no bid no bid no bid
28 | 8 0z. Windscreens 50 ft x 6 ft 216.00 no bid no bid no bid
29 | Pitchers rubber, 4 way youth (4"x18") 24.28 40.00 92.10 no bid
30 | Poly-Cap Fence Guard (Yellow, 250' per roll) 315.27 no bid 295.90 no bid
31 | Bolco 100-ML Major League Bases 146.41 220.00 229.20 no bid
32 | Long String Winders 74.94 no bid 99.45 no bid
33 | Alumagoal, 4 wheel line makers w pnuematic tires (501b) 292.48 399.50 no bid 310.00
34 | Water pump, Diamond Pump 110.66 no bid no bid no bid
35 | Root-Vue Farm no bid no bid no bid 26.95
36 | Creative Botany no bid no bid no bid no bid
37 | Magnification Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid
38 | Treasure Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid
39 | Life Cycle Figurines, 24-Piece Set no bid no bid no bid no bid
40 | The Magic School Bus™: Exploring Bugs, Insects, & Other Creatures no bid no bid no bid no bid
41 | Chick Life Cycle Exploration Set no bid no bid no bid no bid
42 | Creature Peeper no bid no bid no bid no bid
43 | Jumbo Tweezers no bid no bid no bid 8.85
44 | The Bread Pet: A Sourdough Story no bid no bid no bid no bid
45 | Mama Panya’s Pancakes: A Village Tale from Kenya no bid no bid no bid no bid
46 | Fill & Fold Taco & Tortilla Set no bid no bid no bid no bid
47 | Magnetic Healthy Foods no bid no bid no bid no bid
48 | Outdoor Farmhouse Sink no bid no bid no bid no bid
49 | Hutch for Farmhouse Sink no bid no bid no bid no bid
50 | Stainless Steel Pots & Pans Play Set no bid no bid no bid no bid
51 | Stir & Serve Cooking Utensils no bid no bid no bid no bid
52 | Ready to Plant Garden Kit (Pack of 24) no bid no bid no bid 48.25
53 | Table Top Gardener no bid no bid no bid 7.59
54 | Melissa & Doug® Food Groups Set (Set of 21) no bid no bid no bid 21.10
55 | Value Games Easy Pack no bid no bid no bid 115.95
56 | Standard Playing Cards Deck no bid no bid no bid 1.07
57 | Uno 4.88 no bid no bid 5.89
58 | Spyder Pong Game Set no bid no bid no bid 117.30
59 | Mancala 7.56 no bid no bid 7.35
60 | Retro Candy Striped Hoops no bid no bid no bid pack of 12 28.90
61 | Spectrum 10" Playground Ball 6 pack no bid no bid no bid 35.88
62 | Igloo 5 Gallon Beverage Cooler 45.36 no bid no bid 56.00
63 | Half Cone Set (36 count) 13.83 no bid no bid 20.52
64 | Manual Ball Pump 2.87 8.20 no bid 10.20
65 | Super Tumbling Timbers no bid no bid no bid 176.00
66 | Can Jam Disc Game- Class Pack (6) 241.08 no bid no bid 27.30
67 | Tournament Bean Bag Toss 79.93 no bid no bid 149.00
68 | Pro Series Metal Ladder Ball no bid no bid no bid no bid
Bidder guarantees delivery within 8-10 days for in stock items 21-30 days 30 days ARO 3-5 days for stock items
Out-of-stock items may be If mfgs do not have a mid/late
affected by supply chain issues. season price increase, vendor
Reorder Privelege Yes will allow reorder. Yes Yes




