
TOWN OF MANCHESTER TABULATION FOR BID 21/22-52

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT WATERWORKS AND SEWERAGE SUPPLIES

494 MAIN STREET - P.O. BOX 191

MANCHESTER, CONNECTICUT 06045-0191 BID OPENED FEBRUARY 10, 2022

Campbell Foundry Company Core and Main E J Prescott Inc. G & L Water Works Supply Corp. FW Webb Company The Jack Farrelly Co.

Kenneth R. Farrelly, Sales Mgr./Secty. Kevin Anderson, Sales Specialist Alicia Campbell, Division Manager Stanley J. Cop. Jr., Vice President Bob Ciankciosi, Sales Mfr. Waterworks Shannon McCue, Operations Manager

PO Box 515, 14 Massimo Dr. One Hartford Square 400 Middle Street 18 Putnam Place, PO Box 806 150 Locust Street 97 Old Poquonock Road

North Haven, CT 06473 New Britain, CT 06052 Bristol, CT  06010 Cheshire, CT 06410 Hartford, CT 06114 Bloomfield, CT 06002

ITEM# DESCRIPTION Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time

G1 1" x 60' roll Type K Copper Tubing no bid no bid 478.80/roll* 478.80/roll* 25-30 days 7.35/LF 7.35/LF 5 days no bid no bid 473.75         473.75         7 days 908.40         908.40         30 wkg days

G2 1" x 100' roll Type K Copper Tubing no bid no bid 798.00/roll* 798.00/roll* 25-30 days 7.35/LF 7.35/LF 5 days no bid no bid 789.58         789.58         7 days 1,514.00      1,514.00      30-wkg days

H3 Curb box with stainless rod no bid no bid 54.25              54.25             150 days 55.29           55.29           112 days 71.56           71.56           12 weeks 70.83           70.83           7 days no bid no bid

H4 Curb box less rod no bid no bid 35.15              35.15             150 days 35.21           35.21           112 days 43.00           43.00           12 weeks 26.33           26.33           7 days no bid no bid

L5 5-1/4" Dry Barrel 3-nozz w/brk flange no bid no bid 2,468.32        2,468.32        112  days 2,145.73      2,145.73      open R 5 days no bid no bid 2,278.68      2,278.68      16 weeks 2,331.83      2,331.83      80 wkg days

open L 77 days

Qty indicated on bid Qty indicated on bid Qty indicated on bid Qty indicated on bid Qty indicated on bid Qty indicated on bid

P6 HD Regular 4" MH Frame & Cover 318.00         10 days 337.97            112 days 344.51         100 days no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

P7 HD Water Tight 4" MH Frame & Cover 417.00         45 days 371.24            112 days 385.50         100 days no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

P8 HD Regular 6" MH Frame & Cover 340.00         10 days 358.03            112 days 364.97         100 days no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

P9 HD Water Tight 6" MH Frame & Cover 446.00         45 days 400.25            112 days 411.77         100 days no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

P10 HD Regular 8" MH Frame & Cover 388.00         10 days 398.99            112 days 406.72         100 days no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

P11 HD Water Tight 8" MH Frame & Cover 492.00         45 days 443.23            112 days 456.00         100 days no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time

Q12 4" MJ Retainer Gland no bid no bid 49.36              49.36             112 days 43.81           43.81           5 days 42.80           42.80           12 weeks 52.38           52.38           7 - 14 days 55.26           55.26           40 wkg days

Q13 6" MF Retainer Gland no bid no bid 57.40              57.40             112 days 55.23           55.23           5 days 49.90           49.90           12 weeks 63.92           63.92           7 - 14 days 63.36           63.36           40 wkg days

Q14 8" MJ Retainer Gland no bid no bid 78.15              78.15             112 days 73.76           73.76           5 days 69.85           69.85           12 weeks 81.98           81.98           7 - 14 days 83.36           83.36           40 wkg days

Q15 10" MJ Retainer Gland no bid no bid 107.92            107.92           112 days 105.36         105.36         5 days 100.84         100.84         12 weeks 110.98         110.98         7 - 14 days 117.52         117.52         40 wkg days

Q16 12" MJ Retainer Gland no bid no bid 148.03            148.03           112 days 139.25         139.25         5 days 136.50         136.50         12 weeks 153.48         153.48         7 - 14 days 150.14         150.14         40 wkg days

Q17 16" MJ Retainer Gland no bid no bid 258.06            258.06           112 days 234.14         234.14         5 days 249.75         249.75         12 weeks 269.76         269.76         7 - 14 days 272.45         272.45         40 wkg days

Q18 20" MJ Retainer Gland no bid no bid 440.25            440.25           112 days 345.34         345.34         5 days 404.85         404.85         12 weeks 434.74         434.74         7 - 14 days 429.76         429.76         40 wkg days

Q19 24" MJ Retainer Gland no bid no bid 583.19            583.19           112 days 469.23         469.23         10 days 551.93         551.93         12 weeks 589.20         589.20         7 - 14 days 577.51         577.51         40 wkg days

Q20 39" MJ Retainer Gland no bid no bid 1,242.91        1,242.91        112 days 1,108.75      1,108.75      63 days 1,255.40      1,255.40      12 weeks 1,887.99      1,887.99      36-48 weeks 1,255.75      1,255.75      40 wkg days

Q21 36" MJ Retainer Gland no bid no bid 1,578.22        1,578.22        112 days 1,544.78      1,544.78      63 days 1,600.58      1,600.58      12 weeks 1,912.12      1,912.12      36-48 weeks 1,588.97      1,588.97      40 wkg days

Qty indicated on bid Qty indicated on bid Qty indicated on bid Qty indicated on bid Qty indicated on bid Qty indicated on bid

S22 24"x1.25"x1" Manhole Ext Ring CI 137.00         10 days no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

S23 24"x1.25"x1.5" Manhole Ext Ring CI 131.00         40 days 129.87            112 days 132.39         90 days no bid no bid no bid

S24 24"x1.25"x2" Manhole Ext Ring CI 150.00         40 days 147.77            112 days 150.78         90 days no bid no bid no bid

S25 24"x1.25"x3" Manhole Ext Ring CI 242.00         40 days 209.75            112 days 213.81         90 days no bid no bid no bid

Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time

X26 4" Open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid no bid 491.95            491.95           112 days 453.01         453.01         5 days 542.40         542.40         12 weeks 517.68         517.68         12-18 weeks 581.48         581.48         80 wkg days

X27 6" open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid no bid 634.24            634.24           112 days 578.27         578.27         5 days 683.38         683.38         12 weeks 654.86         654.86         12-18 weeks 727.97         727.97         80 wkg days

X28 8" open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid no bid 999.42            999.42           112 days 920.17         920.17         5 days 1,070.85      1,070.85      12 weeks 1,038.47      1,038.47      12-18 weeks 1,125.07      1,125.07      80 wkg days

X29 10" open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid no bid 1,558.24        1,558.24        112 days 1,434.78      1,434.78      5 days 1,654.57      1,654.57      12 weeks 1,611.01      1,611.01      12-18 weeks 1,729.92      1,729.92      80 wkg days

X30 12" open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid no bid 1,971.74        1,971.74        112 days 1,815.28      1,815.28      5 days 2,111.80      2,111.80      12 weeks 2,068.81      2,068.81      12-18 weeks 2,191.79      2,191.79      80 wkg days

X31 16" open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid no bid 6,609.18        6,609.19        112 days 6,084.21      6,084.21      5 days 6,198.25      6,198.25      12 weeks 6,407.46      6,407.46      12-18 weeks 6,894.62      6,894.62      80 wkg days



TOWN OF MANCHESTER TABULATION FOR BID 21/22-52

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT WATERWORKS AND SEWERAGE SUPPLIES

494 MAIN STREET - P.O. BOX 191

MANCHESTER, CONNECTICUT 06045-0191 BID OPENED FEBRUARY 10, 2022

Campbell Foundry Company Core and Main E J Prescott Inc. G & L Water Works Supply Corp. FW Webb Company The Jack Farrelly Co.

Kenneth R. Farrelly, Sales Mgr./Secty. Kevin Anderson, Sales Specialist Alicia Campbell, Division Manager Stanley J. Cop. Jr., Vice President Bob Ciankciosi, Sales Mfr. Waterworks Shannon McCue, Operations Manager

PO Box 515, 14 Massimo Dr. One Hartford Square 400 Middle Street 18 Putnam Place, PO Box 806 150 Locust Street 97 Old Poquonock Road

North Haven, CT 06473 New Britain, CT 06052 Bristol, CT  06010 Cheshire, CT 06410 Hartford, CT 06114 Bloomfield, CT 06002

Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time Qty 1-4 Qty 5-10 Lead Time

U32 4" B x S 22 1/2o Bend no bid no bid 10.71              10.71             28 days 7.06              7.06              5 days no bid no bid 11.27           11.27           7 days 9.50              9.50              80 wkg days

U33 4" B x S 11 1/4o Bend no bid no bid 29.25              29.25             28 days 19.27           19.27           5 days no bid no bid 30.78           30.78           7 days 22.58           22.58           80 wkg days

U34 4" B x S 45o Bend no bid no bid 10.15              10.15             28 days 6.69              6.69              5 days no bid no bid 10.67           10.67           7 days 8.99              8.99              80 wkg days

U35 6" B x S 22 1/2o Bend no bid no bid 21.05              21.05             28 days 18.88           18.88           5 days no bid no bid 22.16           22.16           7 days 18.68           18.68           80 wkg days

U36 6" B x S 11 1/4o Bend no bid no bid 40.09              40.09             28 days 26.41           26.41           5 days no bid no bid 42.19           42.19           7 days 35.55           35.55           80 wkg days

U37 6" B x S 45o Bend no bid no bid 20.27              20.27             28 days 13.36           13.36           5 days no bid no bid 21.34           21.34           7 days 17.98           17.98           80 wkg days

U38 8" B x S 22 1/2o Bend no bid no bid 67.52              67.52             28 days 44.49           44.49           5 days no bid no bid 71.06           71.06           7 days 59.86           59.86           80 wkg days

U39 8" B x S 11 1/4o Bend no bid no bid 64.36              64.36             28 days 44.48           44.48           25 days no bid no bid 67.74           67.74           7 days 59.87           59.87           80 wkg days

U40 8" B x S 45o Bend no bid no bid 61.19              61.19             28 days 40.31           40.31           5 days no bid no bid 64.39           64.39           7 days 54.07           54.07           80 wkg days

U41 6" x 4" B x B Tee Wye no bid no bid 46.97              46.97             28 days 30.94           30.94           5 days no bid no bid 49.42           49.42           7 days 41.63           41.63           80 wkg days

U42 6" x 4" B x B Wye no bid no bid 39.42              39.42             28 days 25.98           25.98           5 days no bid no bid 41.49           41.49           7 days 34.94           34.94           80 wkg days

U43 6" B x B Wye no bid no bid 44.63              44.63             28 days 29.41           29.41           5 days no bid no bid 46.97           46.97           7 days 39.57           39.57           80 wkg days

U44 8" B x B Tee Wye no bid no bid 166.33            166.33           28 days 110.92         110.92         5 days no bid no bid 117.19         117.19         7 days 149.29         149.29         80 wkg days

U45 8" B x B Wye no bid no bid 120.80            120.80           28 days 80.57           80.57           5 days no bid no bid 128.69         128.69         7 days 108.42         108.42         80 wkg days

V46 4" PVC Pipe no bid no bid no bid no bid 2.43              2.43              60 days no bid no bid 2.84/ft 2.84/ft 12 weeks no bid no bid

V47 6" PVC Pipe no bid no bid no bid no bid 5.59              5.59              5 days no bid no bid 6.54/ft 6.54/ft 12 weeks no bid no bid

V48 8" PVD Pipe no bid no bid no bid no bid 10.16           10.16           5 days no bid no bid 11.89/ft 11.89/ft 12 weeks no bid no bid

V49 10" PVC Pipe no bid no bid no bid no bid 15.80           15.80           5 days no bid no bid 18.48/ft 18.48/ft 12 weeks no bid no bid

V50 12" PVC Pipe no bid no bid no bid no bid 19.01           19.01           5 days no bid no bid 26.60/ft 26.60/ft 12 weeks no bid no bid

AA51 3-Piece Valve Box 211.00         211.00         60 days 124.98            124.98           150 days 119.71         119.71         60 days no bid no bid 248.87         248.87         stock no bid no bid

AA52 Top section w/o cover only 80.00           80.00           60 days 56.20              56.20             150 days 54.45           54.45           60 days no bid no bid 63.62           63.62           8-12 weeks no bid no bid

AA53 5 1/4 "gate valve box Cover Only 21.00           21.00           60 days 15.23              15.23             30 days 14.48           14.48           60 days no bid no bid 16.92           16.92           stock

VENDOR NOTES *Due to market volatility, copper prices

firm only until 2/17/22


