
TOWN OF MANCHESTER BID TABULATION FOR BID 21/22-51

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT POLICE UNIFORMS, EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

494 MAIN STREET - P.O. BOX 191 BID OPENED FEBRUARY 8, 2022 AT 11:00 A.M.

MANCHESTER, CONNECTICUT 06045-0191

Connecticut Police Supply Fairfield Uniform Company Horwitz Uniforms New England Uniform Co., LLC.

Ben O'Neill, Manager Todd Gutheil, President Janie Horwitz, Owner Edward P. McGee, Owner

105 Fenn Road 1313 Connecticut Ave, Bldg 1-4 375 Morgan Lane #105 356 Main Street

Newington, CT 06111 Bridgeport, CT 06607 West Haven, CT 06516 Danbury, CT

Item # Item Description

1a Flying Cross Uniform Shirt L/S Male no bid 69.00                                         no bid 68.90                                         

Bidding Model 07W84Z-86

1b Flying Cross Uniform Shirt L/S Female no bid 73.00                                         no bid 68.90                                         

Bidding Model 107W84Z-86

1c Flying Cross Uniform Shirt S/S Male no bid 65.00                                         no bid 63.90                                         

Bidding Model 57R84Z-86

1d Flying Cross Uniform Shirt S/S Female no bid 69.00                                         no bid 63.90                                         

Bidding Model 157R84Z-86

1e Flying Cross Uniform Pants Male no bid 85.00                                         no bid 83.45                                         

Bidding Model 47289-86

1f Flying Cross Uniform Pants Female no bid 85.00                                         no bid 83.45                                         

1g Flying Cross Uniform Reversible Jacket no bid 149.00                                       no bid 153.00                                       

1h Flying Cross Uniform Rain Coat no bid 168.00                                       no bid 169.00                                       

Bidding Anchor #02230

1i Flying Cross Uniform Rain Cap Cover no bid 13.00                                         no bid 8.00                                           

Bidding Anchor Cap Cover

1k Flying Cross ACO Shirt L/S no bid 59.00                                         no bid 55.50                                         

1l Flying Cross ACO Shirt S/S no bid 57.00                                         no bid 53.50                                         

1m Flying Cross ACO  Shirt L/S w/name tape no bid 61.00                                         no bid 59.00                                         

2a Keystone Cap Uniform Hat no bid 44.00                                         42.00                                         49.00                                         

3a Blauer  Shirt L/S Male no bid no bid 66.00                                         77.00                                         

3b Blauer Shirt L/S Female no bid no bid 66.00                                         77.00                                         

3c Blauer Shirt S/S Male no bid no bid 61.00                                         69.00                                         

3d Blauer Shirt S/S Female no bid no bid 61.00                                         69.00                                         

3e Blauer Pants no bid no bid 76.00                                         82.45                                         

3f Direct Embroidery no bid no bid 10.00                                         9.00                                           

3g Name Tags no bid no bid 6.40                                           5.50                                           

3h Blauer Fleece no bid no bid 50.00                                         64.50                                         

3i Blauer Winter Shell no bid no bid 180.00                                       205.00                                       

4a Samuel Broome Uniform Tie - Short no bid 8.00                                           6.00                                           8.00                                           

4b Samuel Broome Uniform Tie Regular no bid 8.00                                           6.00                                           8.00                                           

4c Samuel Broome Tie Long no bid 8.00                                           6.00                                           8.00                                           

5a Boston Leather Pants Belt no bid 24.00                                         no bid 18.00                                         

6a Bianchi Duty Belt 35.94                                         49.00                                         42.00                                         45.00                                         

6b Bianchi Magazine Pouch - Double 24.94                                         34.00                                         31.00                                         29.00                                         

6c Bianchi Magazine Pouch - Single 17.94                                         26.00                                         22.00                                         25.00                                         

6d Bianchi Single Cuff Case 19.94                                         29.00                                         24.00                                         22.00                                         

6e Bianchi Double Cuff Case 17.94                                         26.00                                         22.00                                         27.00                                         

6f Bianchi Glove Pouch 18.94                                         26.00                                         24.00                                         21.00                                         

6g Bianchi Pepper Spray Holder 16.94                                                 26.00                                         21.00                                         22.00                                         

6h Bianchi Belt Keepers 11.94 18.00                                         14.00                                         13.00                                         

7a Safariland Duty Holster - Right Hand 138.94                                       145.00                                       126.00                                       143.00                                       

7b Safariland Duty  Holster - Left Hand 138.94                                       145.00                                       126.00                                       143.00                                       

7c Safariland Duty  Holster - Right Hand 132.94                                       139.00                                       118.00                                       133.00                                       

7d Safariland Duty Holster - Left Hand 132.94                                       139.00                                       58.00                                         133.00                                       

7e Safariland Det Holster 21SF Right Hand 46.94                                         115.00                                       58.00                                         55.00                                         

7f Safariland Det Holster 21SF Left Hand 46.94                                         115.00                                       58.00                                         55.00                                         

7g Safariland Det Holster 30SF Right Hand 38.94                                         115.00                                       62.00                                         45.00                                         

7h Safariland Det Holster 30SF Left Hand 38.94                                         115.00                                       62.00                                         45.00                                         

8a Uncle Mike's Belt Keepers no bid 18.00                                         no bid no bid

9a Monadnock Baton - Patrol 130.94                                       145.00                                       120.00                                       120.00                                       

9b Monadnock Baton - Detective 125.94                                       145.00                                       118.00                                       115.00                                       

9c Monadnock Baton Holder - Patril 26.94                                         36.00                                         30.00                                         30.00                                         

9d Monadnock Baton Holder - Detective 24.94                                         36.00                                         28.00                                         28.00                                         

10a Peerless Chanied Handcuffs 22.94                                         30.00                                         30.00                                         32.00                                         

10b Peerless Hined Handcuffs 30.94                                         42.00                                         38.00                                         44.00                                         

11 Safariland Body Armor 925.94                                       no bid 960.00                                       no bid

12a Blackinton Badge 64.94                                         96.00                                         76.00                                         no bid

12b Blackinton Hat Badge 70.94                                         83.00                                         80.00                                         no bid

12c Blackinton Name Plate 17.94                                         36.00                                         14.00                                         no bid

12d Blackinton Name Plate Attachment 12.94                                         19.00                                         14.00                                         no bid

12e Blackingon Tie Bar 18.94                                         25.00                                         28.00                                         no bid

12f Blackinton Civilian Badge 49.94                                         74.00                                         60.00                                         no bid



TOWN OF MANCHESTER BID TABULATION FOR BID 21/22-51

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT POLICE UNIFORMS, EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

494 MAIN STREET - P.O. BOX 191 BID OPENED FEBRUARY 8, 2022 AT 11:00 A.M.

MANCHESTER, CONNECTICUT 06045-0191

Connecticut Police Supply Fairfield Uniform Company Horwitz Uniforms New England Uniform Co., LLC.

Ben O'Neill, Manager Todd Gutheil, President Janie Horwitz, Owner Edward P. McGee, Owner

105 Fenn Road 1313 Connecticut Ave, Bldg 1-4 375 Morgan Lane #105 356 Main Street

Newington, CT 06111 Bridgeport, CT 06607 West Haven, CT 06516 Danbury, CT

Item # Item Description

14a 5.11 Tactical K-9/ACO Pants 43.94                                         42.00                                         no bid no bid

14b 5.11 Stryker PSA/Disp/Evidence Pants 60.94                                         63.00                                         no bid no bid

14c 5.11 Tactical K-9 Shirt S/S no bid 51.00                                         no bid no bid

Bidding Model 71339-724

14d 5.11 Tactical K-9 Shirt - L/S no bid 53.00                                         no bid no bid

14e 5.11 Stryker Pant SRO/DET/SGT/LT 60.94                                         63.00                                         no bid no bid

14f 5.11 Apex Pant SRO/DET/SGT/LT 59.94                                         63.00                                         no bid no bid

15a 5.11 Performance PSA Shirt L/S no bid 46.00                                         no bid no bid

15b 5.11 Performance PSA Shirt S/S no bid 43.00                                         no bid no bid

15c 5.11 Performance Dispatch Shirt L/S no bid 46.00                                         no bid no bid

15d 5.11 Performance Dispatch Shirt S/S no bid 43.00                                         no bid no bid

15e 5.11 Performance Evid Tech Shirt L/S no bid 46.00                                         no bid no bid

Bidding Model 72049-724

15f 5.11 Performance Evid Tech Shirt S/S no bid 43.00                                         no bid no bid

Bidding Model 71049-724

15g 5.11 Performance PAR Shirt L/S no bid 46.00                                         no bid no bid

15h 5.11 Performance PAR Shirt S/S no bid 43.00                                         no bid no bid

15I 5.11 Performance Detective Shirt L/S no bid 46.00                                         no bid no bid

15j 5.11 Performance Detective Shirt S/S no bid 43.00                                         no bid no bid

16a First Tactival Perf. PSA Shirt L/S no bid no bid 50.00                                         no bid

16b First Tactical Perf. PSA Shirt S/S no bid no bid 48.00                                         no bid

16c First Tactical Perf. Dispatch Shirt L/S no bid no bid 50.00                                         no bid

16d First Tactical Perf. Dispatch Shirt S/S no bid no bid 48.00                                         no bid

16e First Tactival Perf. Evid Tech Shirt L/S no bid no bid 50.00                                         no bid

16f First Tactical Perf. Evid Tech Shirt S/S no bid no bid 48.00                                         no bid

16g First Tactical Perf. PAR Shirt L/S no bid no bid 50.00                                         no bid

16h First Tactical Perf. PAR Shirt S/S no bid no bid 48.00                                         no bid

16i First Tactical Perf. Detective Shirt S/S no bid no bid 50.00                                         no bid

16j First Tactical Perf. Detective Shirt L/S no bid no bid 48.00                                         no bid

17a 5.11 Bike Uniform Shirt no bid 66.00                                         no bid no bid

17b 5.11 Bike Uniform Pants no bid 84.00                                         no bid no bid

17c 5.11 Bike Uniform Jacket no bid 160.00                                       no bid no bid

19a Sabre Red Pepper Spray - Cone 11.94                                         18.00                                         12.00                                         no bid

19b Sabre Red Pepper Spray - Foam 11.94                                         18.00                                         12.00                                         no bid

20a Patch - Blue Background 1.20                                           no bid no bid no bid

20b Patch - White Background 3.09                                           no bid no bid no bid

20c Patch - K-9 3.09                                           no bid no bid no bid

20d Patch - Traffic 3.09                                           no bid no bid no bid

20e Patch - Field Training Officer (FTO) 0.97                                           no bid no bid no bid

20f SGT Chevrons - Small Blue Background 1.03                                           no bid no bid no bid

20g SGT Chevrons - Large Blue Background 0.97                                           no bid no bid no bid

20h Officer Badge Patch 0.72                                           no bid no bid no bid

20i Dispatch Badge Patch 0.97                                           no bid no bid no bid

20j Police Service Aide Badge Patch 1.28                                           no bid no bid no bid

20k ACO Badge Patch 2.88                                           no bid no bid no bid

20l Hash Marks for Years of Service Blue Bkgrd 0.72                                           no bid no bid no bid

20m Hash Marks for Years of Service White Bkgrd 0.72                                           no bid no bid no bid

20n Miniature MPD Patch - Blue Background 0.73                                           no bid no bid no bid

Measuring Services Available Yes Yes Yes Yes


