TOWN OF MANCHESTER
GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT
494 MAIN STREET - P.O. BOX 191

MANCHESTER, CONNECTICUT 06045-0191

TABULATION FOR BID 21/22-1
CHEMICALS
BID OPENED JULY 13, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

Borden & Remington Corp.
Robert F. Bogan, President
PO Box 2573

Fall River, MA 02722

Chemrite, Inc.

Aaron Opp, Vice President
5202 Belle Wood Court
Buford, GA 30518

George S. Coyne Chemical
Co., Inc.

John V. Drzericki, Dir. S&P Dev.
3015 State Road

Croydon, PA 19021

Kemira Water Solutions, Inc.
Christina M. Imbrogno

4321 W. 6th Street
Lawrence, KS 66049

Madigan Lime Corporation
Timothy Madigan, Pres.
450 Old Union Turnpike
Lancaster, MA 01453

Shannon Chemical Corp.
Daniel C. Flynn, VP Oper.
PO Box 376

Malvern, PA 19355

Slack Chemical Co., Inc.
Derek Davis, General Mrg.
PO Box 30

Carthage, NY 13619

1 [Liquid Chlorine (small cylinder) per Ib no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 2.398 |
2 Fluosilicic Acid - 750 gal tanks - per gal 3.4300 no bid no bid no bid no bid 8.9700 6.4400
Fluosilicic Acid - 2,000 gal tanks - per gal 2.4688 no bid no bid no bid no bid 7.07 4.890 |
3 Hydrated Lime High Calcium Bulk per Ib no bhid no bhid no bid no hid 0.1430 no bid no bid
Size of Tank Wagon Ibs no bid no bid no bid no bid 40,000 lbs no bid no bid
4 [Copper Sulfate per Ib no bid [ 2.49 | no bid no hid no hid no bid | no bid |
5 [Sodium Fluoride coarse grade per Ib no bid [ 1.4500 | no bid no bid no bid no bid | 1.193
6 [Liquid Zinc Orthophosphate bulk, per gal no bid [ no bid | 3.5152 | no hid no bid 4.77 | no bid
7 Ferric Chloride Solution per dry Ib. 0.4244 no bid no bid 0.3620 no bid no bid no bid
Number of dry pounds per gallon 4.5045 dry Ib per gal no bid no bid 4.7 dry Ib per gal no bid no bid no bid |
8 |Sodium Hypochlorite 250 gal totes - per gal 1.6800 | no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 2.839




