
TOWN OF MANCHESTER BID TABULATION FOR BID 20/21-45

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT POLICE UNIFORMS, EQUIPMENT & SUPPLIES

494 MAIN STREET - P.O. BOX 191 BID OPENED JANUARY 27, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

MANCHESTER, CONNECTICUT 06045-0191

Fairfield Uniform Company Horwitz Career Apparel & New England Uniform Co., Inc.

Todd Gutheil, President Uniforms Edward P. McGee, Owner

1069 Connecticut Ave, 3A Jeanie Horwitz, Owner 356 Main Street

Bridgeport, CT 06607 375 Morgan Lane, Ste 105 Danbury, CT

West Haven, CT 06516

Item # Item Description

1a Flying Cross Uniform Shirt L/S Male 65.00                                       no bid 66.25                                       

1b Flying Cross Uniform Shirt L/S Female 65.00                                       no bid 66.25                                       

1c Flying Cross Uniform Shirt S/S Male 59.00                                       no bid 60.75                                       

1d Flying Cross Uniform Shirt S/S Female 59.00                                       no bid 60.75                                       

1e Flying Cross Uniform Pants Male 81.00                                       no bid 73.40                                       

1f Flying Cross Uniform Pants Female 81.00                                       no bid 73.40                                       

1h Flying Cross Uniform Reversible Jacket 133.00                                     no bid 160.00                                     

1l Flying Cross ACO Shirt L/S 54.00                                       no bid 49.75                                       

1m Flying Cross ACO Shirt S/S 51.00                                       no bid 47.00                                       

1n Flying Cross ACO  Shirt L/S w/name tape 56.00                                       no bid 54.75                                       

1o Flying Cross ACO Shirt S/S w/name tape 55.00                                       no bid 52.75                                       

3e Blauer Pants no bid 72.00                                       76.75                                       

5a Boston Leather Garrison Belt 20.00                                       28.00                                       22.00                                       

9a Monadnock Baton - Patrol 136.00                                     108.00                                     124.00                                     

9b Monadnock Baton - Detective 136.00                                     102.00                                     120.00                                     

9d Monadnock Baton Holder - Detective 26.00                                       19.00                                       29.00                                       

11 Body Armor Second Chance w/2nd carrier 725.00                                     905.00                                     804.50                                     

12a Blackinton Badge B538 82.00                                       62.00                                       72.75                                       

12b Blackinton Hat Badge B623 62.00                                       64.00                                       66.75                                       

12c Blackinton Name Plate A2388 18.00                                       12.00                                       18.00                                       

12d Blackinton Name Plate Attachment B1693 15.00                                       12.00                                       12.50                                       

12e Blackinton Tie Bar A367 22.00                                       21.00                                       19.00                                       

12f Blackinton Civilian Badge B538 68.00                                       46.00                                       47.00                                       

15a 5.11 Performance PSA Shirt L/S 44.00                                       no bid 51.00                                       

15b 5.11 Performance PSA Shirt S/S 42.00                                       no bid 47.00                                       

15c 5.11 Performance Dispatch Shirt L/S 41.00                                       no bid 51.00                                       

15d 5.11 Performance Dispatch Shirt S/S 39.00                                       no bid 47.00                                       

15e 5.11 Performance Evidence Tech Shirt L/S 41.00                                       no bid 51.00                                       

15f 5.11 Performance Evidence Tech Shirt S/S 39.00                                       no bid 47.00                                       

15g 5.11 Performance PAR Shirt L/S 41.00                                       no bid 51.00                                       

15h 5.11 Performance PAR Shirt S/S 39.00                                       no bid 47.00                                       

Measuring Services Available Yes, any day, any time Yes Yes

Vendor Notes Item 11) Bidding GHARMOR

owned by Safariland


