
 

Campbell Foundry Co. Core and Main LP E.J. Prescott The Jack Farrelly Co. United Concrete Products

Kennety R. Farrelly, Sales Mgr. Robin Ford, District Mgt. Mitch Swierczynski, Sales Shannon McCue, Manager James D. DeBarge, Sales Rp.

14 Massimo Drive One Hartford Square 36 Clark Road 97 Old Poquonock Rd 173 Church St.

North Haven, CT 06473 New Britain, CT 06052 Vernon, CT 06066 Bloomfield, CT 06002 Yalesville, CT 06492

ITEM# DESCRIPTION

1 Flat Rate Trucking Charge Per Delivery N/A No Fee max. $500 20.00                                      375.00                                    

2 8" HDPE Pipe Per LF no bid 3.67                                        3.70                                        3.47                                        no bid

3 10" HDPE Pipe Per LF no bid 5.03                                        5.05                                        4.57                                        no bid

4 12" HDPE Pipe Per LF no bid 5.62                                        6.00                                        5.53                                        no bid

5 15" HDPE Pipe Per LF no bid 7.50                                        7.55                                        7.21                                        no bid

6 18" HDPE Pipe per LF no bid 10.85                                      10.95                                      10.75                                      no bid

7 24" HDPE Pipe per LF no bid 16.66                                      16.85                                      15.89                                      no bid

8 12" RCP per LF no bid no bid no bid no bid 9.50                                        

9 15" RCP per LF no bid no bid no bid no bid 10.25                                      

10 18" RCP per LF no bid no bid no bid no bid 13.00                                      

11 24" RCP per LF no bid no bid no bid no bid 21.00                                      

12 12" RCP (Class V) per LF no bid no bid no bid no bid 10.00                                      

13 15" RCP (Class V) per LF no bid no bid no bid no bid 12.50                                      

14 18" RCP (Class V) per LF no bid no bid no bid no bid 15.25                                      

15 24" RCP (Class V) per LF no bid no bid no bid no bid 23.75                                      

16 6" SDR35 PVC Pipe per LF no bid 2.37                                        no bid 2.59                                        no bid

17 8" SDR35 PVC Pipe per LF no bid 4.26                                        no bid 4.68                                        no bid

18 10" SDR35 PVC Pipe per LF no bid 6.68                                        no bid 7.32                                        no bid

19 12" SDR35 PVC Pipe per LF no bid 9.60                                        no bid 10.51                                      no bid

20 15" SDR35 PVC Pipe per LF no bid 14.26                                      no bid 15.59                                      no bid

21 18" SDR35 PVC Pipe per LF no bid 22.18                                      no bid 24.74                                      no bid

22 21" SDR35 PVC Pipe per LF no bid 31.17                                      no bid 34.78                                      no bid

23 24" SDR35 PVC Pipe per LF no bid 39.80                                      no bid 44.39                                      no bid

24 12" Corrugated Poly Culvert End no bid 138.00                                    140.00                                    152.00                                    no bid

25 15" Corrugated Poly Culvert End no bid 138.00                                    140.00                                    152.00                                    no bid

26 18" Corrugated Poly Culvert End no bid 184.00                                    185.00                                    203.00                                    no bid

27 24" Corrugated Poly Culvert End no bid 235.00                                    240.00                                    261.00                                    no bid

28 12" Reinforced Concrete Culvert End no bid no bid no bid no bid 330.00                                    

29 15" Reinforced Concrete Culvert End no bid no bid no bid no bid 365.00                                    

30 18" Reinforced Concrete Culvert End no bid no bid no bid no bid 390.00                                    

31 24" Reinforced Concrete Culvert End no bid no bid no bid no bid 496.00                                    

32 6" Base Slab for single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 165.00                                    

33 6" Base Slab for Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 275.00                                    

34 6" Base Slab for Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 275.00                                    

35 12" Sump for Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

36 18" Sump for Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

37 24" Sump for Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 220.00                                    

38 24" Sump for Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 435.00                                    

39 24" Sump for Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 495.00                                    

40 6" Riser for Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

41 6" Riser for Type I Double CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

42 6" Riser for Type II Double CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

43 8" Riser for Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 140.00                                    

44 8" Riser for Type 1 Double CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 150.00                                    

45 6" Riser for Type II Double CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

46 12" Riser for Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 130.00                                    

47 24" Riser for Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 240.00                                    

48 36" Riser for Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 325.00                                    

49 48" Riser for Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 425.00                                    

50 12" Riser for Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 195.00                                    

51 24" Riser for Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 300.00                                    

52 36" Riser for Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 450.00                                    

53 48" Riser for Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 600.00                                    

54 12" Riser for Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 240.00                                    

55 24" Riser for Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 345.00                                    

56 36" Riser for Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 450.00                                    

57 48" Riser for Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 600.00                                    

58 12" Adapter for Type C Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

59 12" Adapter for Type CL Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

60 12" Adapter for Type C Dbl Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

61 12" Adapter for Type CL Dbl Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

62 12" Adapter for Type C Dbl Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

63 12" Adapter for Type CL Dbl Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

64 6" Spacer for Type C Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 75.00                                      

65 6" Spacer for Type CL Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 75.00                                      

66 6" Spacer for Type C Dbl Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

67 6" Spacer for Type CL Dbl Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

68 6" Spacer for Type C Dbl Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

69 6" Spacer for Type CL Dbl Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

70 12" Spacer for Type C Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 130.00                                    

71 12" Spacer for Type CL Single CB no bid no bid no bid no bid 130.00                                    

72 12" Spacer for Type C Dbl Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

73 12" Spacer for Type CL Dbl Type I CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

74 12" Spacer for Type C Dbl Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

75 12" Spacer for Type CL Dbl Type II CB no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid
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76 Type C CB Top Bitum Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 430.00                                    

77 Type C CB Top Low Profile Bitum Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 430.00                                    

78 Type C Dbl Type I CB Bitum Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 925.00                                    

79 Type C Dbl Type II CB Top Bitum Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 975.00                                    

80 Type C CB Top Park Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 430.00                                    

81 Type C CB Top Low Profile Park Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 430.00                                    

82 Type C Dbl Type I CB Top Park Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 925.00                                    

83 Type C Dbl Type II CB Top Park Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 975.00                                    

84 Type C CB Top Concrete Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 430.00                                    

85 Type C CB Top Low Profile Concr Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 430.00                                    

86 Type C Dbl Type I CB Top Concr Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 925.00                                    

87 Type C Dbl Type II CB Top Concr Curb no bid no bid no bid no bid 1,050.00                                 

88 Type C CB Top Barrier Type no bid no bid no bid no bid 430.00                                    

89 Type C CB Top Low Profile Barrier no bid no bid no bid no bid 430.00                                    

90 Type C Dbl Type I CB Top Barrier no bid no bid no bid no bid 925.00                                    

91 Type C DBL Type II CB Top Barrier no bid no bid no bid no bid 925.00                                    

92 Type CL CB Top no bid no bid no bid no bid 430.00                                    

93 Type CL CB Top Heavy Duty no bid no bid no bid no bid 925.00                                    

94 Type CL Dbl Type I CB Top no bid no bid no bid no bid 925.00                                    

95 Type CL Dbl Type II CB Top no bid no bid no bid no bid 925.00                                    

96 Type CL CB Top Barrier Type no bid no bid no bid no bid 430.00                                    

97 Type CL Dbl Type I CB Top Barrier Type no bid no bid no bid no bid 925.00                                    

98 Type CL Dbl Type II CB Top Barrier Type no bid no bid no bid no bid 925.00                                    

99 6" Conversion Slab Single no bid no bid no bid no bid 265.00                                    

100 6" Conversion Slab Dbl Type I no bid no bid no bid no bid 545.00                                    

101 6" Concersion Slab Dbl Type II no bid no bid no bid no bid 545.00                                    

102 Galvanized Catch Basin Grate Risers no bid no bid no bid no bid 120.00                                    

103 Manhole Block 8"w x 6"h x 12"l no bid no bid no bid no bid 3.38                                        

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid 96

104 4" x 8" x 16" Solid Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

105 6" x 8" x 12" Solid Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid 3.38                                        

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid 96

106 6" x 8" x 16" Solid Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

107 8" x 16" x 1-3/4" Solid Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

108 6" X 8" X 8" Grade N-II Hollow Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

109 6" x 8" x 16" Grade N-II Hollow Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

110 8" x 8" x 16" Grade N-II Hollow Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

111 12" x 8" x 16" Grade N-II Hollow Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

112 8" x 8" x 16" Grade S-II Hollow Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

113 12" x 8" x 16" Grade S-II Hollow Blocks no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

114 2" x 8" x 12" Concrete Patio Block no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

115 Concrete Bricks 3-5/8" x 2-1/4" x 7-5/8" no bid no bid no bid no bid 0.64                                        

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid 864

116 Clay Common Bricks 3-5/8"x2-1/4"x7-5/8" no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

Number of Blocks per Pallet no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

117 Galvanized Frame and Grate no bid no bid no bid no bid 370.00                                    

118 Catch Basin Grate - Galvanized 201.00                                    no bid 285.00                                    no bid 240.00                                    

119 Catch Basin Grate - Painted no bid no bid no bid no bid 205.00                                    

120 HD Reg 4" Manhole Frame & Cover 302.00                                    278.00                                    400.00                                    no bid no bid

121 HD Reg 6" Manhole Frame & Cover 325.00                                    300.00                                    430.00                                    no bid no bid

122 HD Reg 8" Manhole Frame & Cover 366.00                                    337.00                                    440.00                                    no bid no bid

123 Manhole Cover Only to fit 120,121,122 168.00                                    155.00                                    220.00                                    no bid no bid

124 Poly Manhole Risers 24"x 1-1/4" x 5/8" no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

125 Poly Manhole Risers 24"x 1-1/4" x 1" no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

126 Poly Manhole Risers 24"x 1-1/4" x 1-1/2" no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

127 Poly Manhole Risers 24"x 1-1/4" x 2" no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

128 Manhole Risers Cast Iron 24"x 1-1/4"x 5/8" no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

129 Manhole Risers Cast Iron 24"x1-1/4"X1" steel    134.00 109.00                                    175.00                                    no bid no bid

130 Manhole Risers Cast Iron 24"x1-1/4"x 1-1/2" 92.00                                      124.00                                    110.00                                    no bid no bid

131 Manhole Risers Cast Iron 24" x 1-1/4" x 2" 92.00                                      177.00                                    110.00                                    no bid no bid

132 12" Ductile Iron Pipe, Class 52 no bid 38.75                                      no bid 39.48                                      no bid

133 14" Ductile Iron Pipe, Class 52 no bid 48.00                                      no bid 74.87                                      no bid

134 16" Ductile Iron Pipe, Class 52 no bid 56.25                                      no bid 57.13                                      no bid

135 2'x2'x6' Concrete Block, Interlocking no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

136 2'x3'x6' Concrete Block, interlocking no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

138 Erosion Control Blanket no bid 99.00                                      105.00                                    no bid no bid

indicate size of roll no bid 2.8' x 112' (100 sy) C125  8 x 112 (100 sy) no bid no bid

139 Sedimentation Control Fence no bid 18.75                                      25.00                                      24.65                                      no bid

indicate size of roll no bid not indicated 3' x 100' 100 LF no bid

140 Basin Knock Out Risers 24" no bid no bid no bid no bid 195.00                                    

141 Basin Knock Out Risers 36" no bid no bid no bid no bid 260.00                                    

142 4" Corr. Perf. Sock wrapped pipe 100LF no bid .65/LF .67/LF 88.00                                      no bid

144 6" Corr. Perf. Sock wrapped pipe 100LF no bid 1.53/LF 1.60/LF 191.00                                    no bid

Prices for Items 16 - 23 are

valid through 3-26-21


