
TOWN OF MANCHESTER TABULATION FOR BID 20/21-50

PURCHASING DEPARTMENT ATHLETIC SUPPLIES

494 MAIN STREET 

PO BOX 191 BID OPENED FEBRUARY 18, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

MANCHESTER, CT 06045-0191

Aluminum Athletic Bill Fritz Sports Corp. BSN Sports, LLC Pioneer Manufacturing Co. Pyramid School Products Riddell S & S Worldwide

Equipment Co. Bill Fritz, President John Stafford, Sr. Bid D. Ford, Bid Coordinator Kenneth D. Miller, VP James Brady, Natl. Bid Carol Mares, Bid Analyst

Tom Syron, VP of Sales 1072 Classic Road PO Box 7726 4529 Industrial Parkway 6510 North 54th Street Dept. Manager 75 Mill Street

1000 Enterprise Drive Apex, NC 27539 Dallas, TX 75209-0726 Cleveland, OH 44135 Tampa, FL  33610-1908 7501 Performance Lane Colchester, CT 06415

Royersford, PA 19468 No. Ridgeville, OH 44029

Item # Description

1 Tachikara Volleyball - White no bid 24.49                                        27.43                                        no bid 23.50                                        28.77                                        26.60                                        

2 Softballs Worth Green Dot 11" COR-44 no bid no bid no bid no bid 46.00                                        no bid no bid

3 Mancala Game no bid 14.90                                        8.41                                          no bid no bid no bid 6.45                                          

4 Economy Playing Cards no bid no bid 10.08/dz (.84 ea) no bid no bid no bid (1 pk of 12)  6.00

5 Jumbo Checkers/Backgammon no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 13.45                                        

6 Mini Red/White/Blue Basketball no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 2.98                                          

7 Franklin Competition Soccer Balls - Size 3 no bid no bid 5.79                                          no bid no bid no bid 6.30                                          

8 Yoga Blocks (2 per set) no bid no bid 6.58                                          no bid no bid no bid 6.18                                          

9 Giant 2-in-1 Four in a Row no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 33.95                                        

Standard Weight Baseball/Little League Field Tarps: no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

10 ft circle, 8 oz standard weight no bid 104.35                                      109.98                                      189.95                                      160.00                                      no bid no bid

18 ft circle, 8 oz standard weight no bid 149.00                                      (20')  114.98 299.95                                      219.00                                      no bid no bid

26 ft circle, 8 oz standard weight no bid 360.00                                      164.98                                      399.95                                      292.00                                      no bid no bid

11 Double Play Rake 36" 75.00                                        no bid 45.98                                        119.95                                      80.00                                        95.69                                        no bid

8 oz. Windscreens 38 ft x 6 ft no bid 225.00                                      148.20                                      249.95                                      no bid no bid no bid

8 oz. Windscreens  50 ft x 6 ft no bid 274.00                                      195.00                                      279.95                                      no bid no bid no bid

13 Pitchers rubber, 4 way youth (4"x18") 81.00                                        no bid 18.98                                        89.95                                        36.00                                        43.40                                        no bid

14 Adjustable Batter's Box Template no bid 289.00                                      199.91                                      379.95                                      276.00                                      no bid no bid

15 Bolco 100-ML Major League Bases 175.00                                      443.00/sest of 3 159.98                                      229.99                                      205.00                                      246.78                                      no bid

16 Long String Winders no bid 61.20                                        21.98                                        131.45                                      66.00                                        no bid no bid

17 Alumagoal, 4 wh. line makers w pnuem. tires (50lb) no bid 282.00                                      184.98                                      409.95                                      279.00                                      no bid no bid

Kettle Bells - Black 10 lb no bid no bid 11.19                                        no bid no bid no bid no bid

Kettle Bells - Black 15 lb no bid no bid 16.79                                        no bid no bid no bid no bid

Kettle Bells - Black 18 lb no bid no bid (20 lb)  22.29 no bid no bid no bid no bid

19 Pro Style Round Rubber Dumb Bell-55 lb. no bid no bid 66.98                                        no bid no bid no bid no bid

20 Pro Style Round Rubber Dumb Bell-60 lb. no bid no bid 72.98                                        no bid no bid no bid no bid

21 Pro Style Round Rubber Dumb Bell-65 lb. no bid no bid 78.98                                        no bid no bid no bid no bid

22 Pro Style Round Rubber Dumb Bell-70 lb. no bid no bid 84.98                                        no bid no bid no bid no bid

23 Pro Style Round Rubber Dumb Bell-75 lb. no bid no bid 90.98                                        no bid no bid no bid no bid

24 Pro Style Round Rubber Dumb Bell-80 lb. no bid no bid 96.98                                        no bid no bid no bid no bid

25 Single Grip Handle Strap no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

26 Pro Bar Wrap Pad no bid no bid 7.98                                          no bid no bid no bid no bid

27 Razor Spark Scooter- clear no bid no bid 63.91                                        no bid no bid no bid no bid

28 Stiga® Legacy Table Tennis Table no bid 440.00                                      364.91                                      no bid 380.00                                      no bid 298.00                                      

29 Ping Pong Paddle (sets of 2) no bid no bid no bid no bid 258.00                                      no bid (set of 6)   7.92

30 Ramin Billiard Cue - 52" no bid no bid 5.98                                          no bid no bid no bid (pack of 2)  10.60

31 Table Tennis Balls no bid no bid 21.98/gross (144) no bid 2.66                                          no bid (pack of 144)  25.10

32 Billiard Ball Set - Official Size no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

33 Hercules folding chairs no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

34 Viewsonic PA503S Ready DLP Projector no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

35 Samsung Crystal TU 7000 4K SmartTV LED LCD TV 49.5" no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

36 YardMaster 2 White 135" Portable Projection Screen no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

37 Williams Allegro III Keyboard Intro Package no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

38 Ibanez Artwood Solid Top Acoustic Guitar no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

39 Squier Affinity Series Special Strat Electric Guitar no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

40 Squier Affinity Telecaster HH Electric Guitar no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

41 Peavey Guitar Modeling Combo Amp no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

42 Braided Instrument Cable 1/4" black 20 ft. no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

43 DR Uniform Kids Lab Coat size 16-18 no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

44 Superwerx Deluxe 880 Cover Goggle no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid 2.42                                          

Bidder agrees to a re-order privelege through 9.30.21 Yes Yes Yes Yes Yes Did not indicate
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