
TOWN OF MANCHESTER TABULATION FOR BID 20/21-41

GENERAL SERVICES DEPARTMENT WATERWORKS AND SEWERAGE SUPPLIES

494 MAIN STREET - P.O. BOX 191

MANCHESTER, CONNECTICUT 06045-0191 BID OPENED APRIL 13, 2021 AT 11:00 A.M.

Campbell Foundry Co. Core and Main LP E J Prescott Ferguson Waterworks FW Webb Company G & L Water Works Supply Corp. The Jack Farrelly Company Ti-Sales Inc.

Kenneth Farrelly, Sales Mgr. Kevin Anderson, Sales Spec. Mittch Swierczynski, Sales Kirby Bombard, Branch Manager Rory J. Budds, Dir. of Waterworks Stanley J. Cop, Jr., Vice-Pres. Shannon McCue, Manager Martin Mazzella, President

14 Massimo Drive One Hartford Square 36 Clark Road 124 Costello Road 150 Locust Street 18 Putnam Place 97 Old Poquonock Road 36 Hudson Road

North Haven, CT 06473 New Britain, CT 06052 Vernon, CT 06066 Newington, CT 06111 Hartford, CT 06114 PO Box 806 Bloomfield, CG06002 Sudbury, MA 01776

Cheshire, CT 06410

ITEM# DESCRIPTION Qty 1-4 / QTY 5-10

G1 1" x 60' roll Type K Copper Tubing no bid 484.20                                                 477.60                                                 624.38 / 610.81 353.00                                                     no bid no bid no bid

G2 1" x 100' roll Type K Copper Tubing no bid 807.00                                                 796.00                                                 624.38 - 610.81 575.00                                                     no bid no bid no bid

H3 Curb box with stainless rod no bid 56.81                                                   52.95                                                   55.29                                                   53.50                                                        57.85                                                        89.51                                                   no bid

L4 5-1/4" Dry Barrel 3-nozz w/ba flange no bid 2,009.52                                              1,865.00                                              2,050.00                                              1,858.99                                                  no bid 1,883.53                                              no bid

P5 HD Regular 4" MH Frame & Cover 328.00                                                 298.87                                                 no bid 304.55                                                 no bid no bid no bid no bid

P6 HD Water Tight 4" MH Frame & Cover 392.00                                                 352.27                                                 no bid 349.18                                                 no bid no bid no bid no bid

P7 HD Regular 6" MH Frame & Cover 355.00                                                 321.59                                                 no bid 328.33                                                 no bid no bid no bid no bid

P8 HD Water Tight 6" MH Frame & Cover 403.00                                                 381.81                                                 no bid 372.98                                                 no bid no bid no bid no bid

P9 HD Regular 8" MH Frame & Cover 398.00                                                 357.95                                                 no bid 368.41                                                 no bid no bid no bid no bid

P10 10" MJ Bolt & Gasket Pk Less Gland 446.00                                                 455.50                                                 no bid 413.04                                                 no bid no bid no bid no bid

Q11 4" MJ Retainer Gland no bid 20.44                                                   29.75                                                   19.51                                                   20.67                                                        27.85                                                        25.83                                                   no bid

Q12 6" MF Retainer Gland no bid 24.05                                                   37.55                                                   22.97                                                   23.97                                                        33.25                                                        31.18                                                   no bid

Q13 8" MJ Retainer Gland no bid 36.71                                                   50.15                                                   35.18                                                   35.92                                                        45.63                                                        43.61                                                   no bid

Q14 10" MJ Retainer Gland no bid 54.34                                                   71.65                                                   52.19                                                   52.50                                                        65.64                                                        62.61                                                   no bid

Q15 12" MJ Retainer Gland no bid 79.06                                                   94.65                                                   76.22                                                   73.45                                                        88.65                                                        84.51                                                   no bid

Q16 4" MJ Bolt & Gasket Packs less gland no bid 13.10                                                   no bid 10.09                                                   10.70                                                        9.21                                                          9.42                                                      no bid

Q17 6" MJ Bolt & Gasket Packs less gland no bid 16.00                                                   no bid 14.83                                                   13.38                                                        11.25                                                        11.92                                                   no bid

Q18 8" MJ Bolt & Gasket Packs less gland no bid 17.46                                                   no bid 15.00                                                   14.92                                                        12.31                                                        14.01                                                   no bid

Q19 10" MJ Bolt & Gasket Packs less gland no bid 23.28                                                   no bid 18.86                                                   21.26                                                        16.40                                                        18.72                                                   no bid

Q20 12" MJ Bolt & Gasket Packs less gland no bid 24.73                                                   no bid 23.98                                                   23.33                                                        17.43                                                        20.35                                                   no bid

S21 24"x1.25"x1" Manhole Ext Ring CI 130.00                                                 N/A no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid no bid

S22 24"x1.25"x1.5" Manhole Ext Ring CI 130.00                                                 120.25                                                 no bid 119.91                                                 no bid no bid no bid no bid

S23 24"x1.25"x2" Manhole Ext Ring CI 148.00                                                 135.22                                                 no bid 136.44                                                 no bid no bid no bid no bid

S24 24"x1.25"x3" Manhole Ext Ring CI 209.00                                                 189.83                                                 no bid 193.67                                                 no bid no bid no bid no bid

X25 4" Open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid 418.99                                                 429.85                                                 428.00                                                 411.69                                                     419.60                                                      415.87                                                 601.34                                                 

X26 6" open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid 534.44                                                 548.85                                                 545.92                                                 522.51                                                     531.20                                                      527.37                                                 755.14                                                 

X27 8" open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid 851.18                                                 873.41                                                 860.23                                                 815.99                                                     833.35                                                      828.73                                                 1,173.46                                              

X28 10" open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid 1,327.14                                              1,361.55                                              1,341.27                                              1,263.00                                                  1,287.70                                                  1,282.23                                              1,807.30                                              

X29 12" open L or R RW Gate Valve no bid 1,679.32                                              1,722.85                                              1,697.19                                              1,597.82                                                  1,639.85                                                  1,632.31                                              2,304.28                                              

Y30 4"X1" IP Service SS Straps no bid 35.77                                                   34.95                                                   59.74                                                   no bid 33.82                                                        61.11                                                   no bid

Y31 4"x1.25" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 39.07                                                   38.10                                                   65.03                                                   no bid 37.05                                                        67.30                                                   no bid

Y32 4"x1.5" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 39.07                                                   38.10                                                   65.03                                                   no bid 40.99                                                        67.30                                                   no bid

Y33 4"x2" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 43.75                                                   38.10                                                   71.95                                                   no bid 41.50                                                        67.30                                                   no bid

Y34 6"x1" Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 41.23                                                   40.20                                                   67.12                                                   no bid 39.10                                                        70.97                                                   no bid

Y35 6"x1.25" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 40.25                                                   43.65                                                   72.90                                                   no bid 38.18                                                        76.58                                                   no bid

Y36 6" x 1.5" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 40.25                                                   43.65                                                   72.90                                                   no bid 38.18                                                        76.58                                                   no bid

Y37 6" x 2" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 44.28                                                   43.65                                                   80.44                                                   no bid 41.99                                                        76.58                                                   no bid

Y38 8" x 1" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 46.78                                                   46.70                                                   77.58                                                   no bid 44.35                                                        81.35                                                   no bid

Y39 8"x1.25" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 50.77                                                   49.80                                                   83.95                                                   no bid 48.15                                                        87.50                                                   no bid

Y40 8" x 1.5" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 50.77                                                   49.80                                                   83.95                                                   no bid 48.15                                                        87.50                                                   no bid

Y41 8" x 2" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 55.39                                                   49.80                                                   91.59                                                   no bid 52.53                                                        87.50                                                   no bid

Y42 10" x 1" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 51.46                                                   56.40                                                   92.21                                                   no bid 48.80                                                        98.23                                                   no bid

Y43 10" x 1.25" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 55.36                                                   60.80                                                   99.20                                                   no bid 52.50                                                        106.94                                                 no bid

Y44 10" x 1.5" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 55.36                                                   60.80                                                   99.20                                                   no bid 52.50                                                        106.94                                                 no bid

Y45 10" x 2" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 59.70                                                   60.80                                                   106.96                                                 no bid 56.62                                                        106.94                                                 no bid

Y46 12" x 1" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 59.90                                                   65.65                                                   107.30                                                 no bid 56.80                                                        102.19                                                 no bid

Y47 12"x1.25" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 64.15                                                   70.35                                                   114.92                                                 no bid 60.84                                                        115.01                                                 no bid

Y48 12" x 1.5" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 64.15                                                   70.35                                                   114.92                                                 no bid 60.84                                                        115.01                                                 no bid

Y49 12" x 2" IP Service Saddle SS Straps no bid 68.62                                                   70.35                                                   122.93                                                 no bid 65.05                                                        115.01                                                 no bid

AA50 3-Piece Valve Box no bid 135.92                                                 115.70                                                 128.40                                                 133.31                                                     114.45                                                      120.81                                                 no bid

AA51 Top section w/o cover only no bid 62.54                                                   53.14                                                   15.56                                                   57.50                                                        65.90                                                        54.94                                                   no bid

AA52 5 1/4 "gate valve box Cover Only no bid 16.64                                                   14.00                                                   58.44                                                   15.50                                                        13.85                                                        14.62                                                   no bid

VENDOR NOTES All copper prices can only be Bidding retainer glands in packs

held if a firm, non-cancelable include gasket & T-bolts/nuts

PO is placed by 4/23/21


